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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided a<er the shipment.Pages Number: 194 Publisher: Beijing Normal University Pub. Date :2011-3-1. This
book consists of three parts. the first part from the role of problem-solving. problem solving and problem-
solving requires three aspects of the general process of secondary school mathematics problem-solving theory;
The second section describes commonly used in middle school math problem-solving way of thinking. such as
the idea of ??return. generalization and specialization. analysis and synthesis. deduction. induction and
analogy. Shuxingjiege. Category talk. model ideas. etc.; first three parts of the theory of secondary school
mathematics problem-solving methods and ideas studies. the topics chosen are: equations. inequalities. series.
functions. geometric transformations. three-dimensional geometry. elementary number theory. combined
preliminary and so on. This book is for prospective mathematics teachers colleges prepare teachers for
teaching. But the reader not just limited to students of mathematics teachers colleges. the majority of
secondary school mathematics teachers. teaching and research staE. students. and better mathematics
learning mathematical problem solving in secondary schools interested in the university teachers. researchers
and so can be a book reader . I believe readers of the book according to the requirements in the problem-
solving and research will be able to have a very large harvest. Contents: Chapter 1. the general theory of
mathematical problem solving secondary school mathematics problem solving 1.1 1.1.1 The role of
mathematical problem-solving help to deepen understanding of the basics to help a firm grasp of the
knowledge system. there help to gradually form and perfect sound mathematical knowledge? structure helps
improve math 1.1.2 math problem-solving ability. especially mathematical problem-solving mathematics
problem-solving ability 1.1.3 help develop good moral character 1.2 high school math problem solving and
personality of the basic requirements of 1.2.1 careful...
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